
Global Perspectives on Religion and HIV/AIDS

Call for Proposals
  

This Seminar brings together an interdisciplinary group of scholars to develop an analysis of the
various roles religion has played historically and continues to occupy in shaping the global AIDS
pandemic. In addition to building theoretical and conceptual tools for understanding religion and
AIDS, we aim to create an anthology appropriate for a wide academic audience interested in the
religious and moral dimensions of the AIDS epidemic, including their effects on the lived
experience of disease and the formation of religious and public health efforts to fight HIV/AIDS
and prevent infection. Much of the work of our multiyear Seminar focuses on creating an
internally cohesive project that incorporates our diverse methodological and regional
perspectives, but shares a set of common themes and questions concerning the convergence
of religion and HIV/AIDS over the past three decades. We seek to advance existing research
and to foster new studies of this important, emerging field and welcome proposals from a range
of disciplinary and/or regional perspectives.

  Mission
  

This Seminar brings together an interdisciplinary group of scholars to develop an analysis of the
various roles religion has played historically and continues to occupy in shaping the global AIDS
pandemic. In addition to building theoretical and conceptual tools for understanding religion and
AIDS, we aim to create an anthology appropriate for a wide academic audience interested in the
religious and moral dimensions of the AIDS epidemic, including their effects on the lived
experience of disease and the formation of religious and public health efforts to fight HIV/AIDS
and prevent infection. Much of the work of our multiyear Seminar focuses on creating an
internally cohesive project that incorporates our diverse methodological and regional
perspectives, but shares a set of common themes and questions concerning the convergence
of religion and HIV/AIDS over the past three decades. We seek to advance existing research
and to foster new studies of this important, emerging field.

  Anonymity of Review Process
  

Proposer names are visible to chairs and steering committee members at all times.

  Questions?
  

Lynne Gerber
University of California, Berkeley
           This e-mail address is being protected from spambots. You need JavaScript enabled to
view it      
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Anthony Petro
New York University
           This e-mail address is being protected from spambots. You need JavaScript enabled to
view it      

  Method of Submission
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