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  Challenging Assumptions and Encouraging Engagement
  

While boarding an airplane for Cuba, one of my students turned to me and said that this was
her first time on an airplane. Then another said “Me, too,” and yet another, “Same with me.” Not
only was this the first time out of the United States for all but one of these nine undergraduate
students, but it was the first time on an airplane for three. Right there on the jet-bridge, I
whipped out my camera to document this historic occasion. The flight attendant welcomed the
first-time fliers onto the plane and even posed for a snapshot. Suddenly I felt a heavier weight of
responsibility on my shoulders to chaperone inexperienced travelers on an international service
trip, especially to a country like Cuba! But I also saw an incredible window of learning
opportunities.

  

In my undergraduate religion classes at Pfeiffer University, I include the course objectives of
encouraging critical thinking and civic engagement. When attempting to teach these skills, it is
crucial to encourage students to examine their assumptions. Yet this is easier said than done.
This is particularly the case at my institution, where 50 percent of the undergraduates are
first-generation college students, and 80 percent of the students come from within a fifty-mile
radius of North Carolina’s central Piedmont region. My theory is that many prospective students
choose a college close to home precisely not to challenge their assumptions. This context
makes recruiting students for international service trips all the more challenging, but at the same
time, all the more rewarding. The background of my students places my course objectives
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directly at odds with my students’ goals (and perhaps their parents’ fears).

  

While it is possible to teach critical thinking and civic engagement in the classroom through
reading and videos — I also like case studies — I find that there is nothing like traveling outside
one’s own country to experience another culture. The objective of this particular international
service trip was for the students to challenge their assumptions and prejudices through personal
interaction with Cubans in the context of a service project. The first-hand knowledge of the
Cuban situation, enhanced by personal encounters with Cubans, facilitates cognitive
dissonance in which original assumptions are challenged with the acquisition of new
information. 

  

Students did not earn academic credit for participating in this international service-learning
program, but they did earn fifteen cultural credits, which is Pfeiffer University’s system for
encouraging extracurricular activities. The process leading up to the actual trip lasted a full year.
First, we recruited students through information sessions and presentations by students who
had traveled on previous service-learning programs. Then we began orientation sessions in the
fall with guest speakers, videos, and readings. Finally, in the spring semester immediately prior
to our departure, the intensity turned up a notch with background reading on the history, culture,
and politics of Cuba. We also collected medical supplies to donate to the medical commission of
the Methodist Church in Cuba, which was our host and community partner. I required the
students to keep a journal to reflect on their reading: they were required to continue this
exercise during the trip. While actually in Cuba, in spite of a full in-country schedule of service in
the form of building an apartment building for retired pastors in the central province of Las
Villas, as well as encounters with Cubans and visits to historical and cultural sights, we also
held nightly reflection sessions. I constantly came back to the question: is what you are seeing
and hearing different from your expectations? Typical answers included “I thought there would
be a lot more poverty” or “I thought that the houses would have dirt floors and that there
wouldn’t be running water or electricity.” 

  

Naturally we did see hardships and shortages of basic commodities like medicine, which led to
good discussions about the Cuban health care system, and eventually to the topic of the United
States embargo. We hand-carried our donations of medicines into Cuba and were able to
distribute them to medical personnel. One disturbing fact that students wrestled with is that the
embargo includes medicine. Even at the height of the Iraq war, the United States never
restricted medicines to Saddam Hussein. This and other troubling facts about United States
foreign policy contributed to cognitive dissonance regarding what our government has told us
about Cuba. The next step is to move from critical thinking to civic engagement. Upon returning,
most students were committed to writing to their elected representatives and to seeking
speaking engagements in churches and civic organizations. 

 2 / 3



Civic Engagement and International Service-Learning

  

Having completed the international service-learning program, the primary difficulty that I have as
an instructor is how to assess this follow-up civic action as part of the course. And then again, if
it is required as part of the course (read coerced), then have I accomplished the learning
objective of civic engagement or simply exerted power over students to fulfill an
assignment? This leads to a larger service-learning question: how can we assess the learning
outcome of civic engagement if it is required as part of a course?
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